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ClinicalResearchMethodologyWorkshop 
 
 
Date:18/01/2022-20/01/2022 Time:09.00AM-05.00PM 

Venue:LectureHall:4 No.ofparticipants:75 
 
 
 
Summary: 

Sri Venkateswara dental college and hospital, Thalambur, organized a 3 
daysresearch methodology workshop on 18th to 20th of January,2022 at lecture 
hall 4.There were 75 participants who enrolled for the workshop that was 
scheduledfrom 09.00 AM to 05.00 PM. The three-day workshop covered the 
topics likeIntroduction to research methods, Research design, Design of sample 
surveyetc.,onthefirstday.Measurementofscalingconcepts,dataanalysisandcollecti
on, report writing were discussed on the second day. The third day hadtopics 
like Computer applications and errors in measurement following 
whichquestionandanswersessionwereconductedandthecertificateofattendancehas
beenissued toalltheparticipants. 
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SRIVENKATESWARADENTALCOLLEGEANDHOSPITAL 
 

 

ResearchMethodologyLectureforpost-graduates 
 
 

 
Date:07/06/2021,14/06/2021, 21/06/2021,28/06/2021,05/07/21 

Time:09.00 AM-05.00PM 

Venue:LectureHall:4 No.ofparticipants:125 
 
 
Summary: 

Sri Venkateswara dental college and hospital, Thalambur, organized a 
weeklyonceresearchmethodologylectureforabout125postgraduatestudentsatlectu
rehall4from09.00AMto05.00PM.On7thJune2021,thetopicpresented was 
systematic review- A walk through. Other topics like How topublish an article, 
research design for in-vitro studies, how to write a researcharticle and how to 
select a research topic were all discussed on 14th, 21st, 28thJune and 5th of July 
respectively. Certificate of attendance for all the five dayswere issued to all the 
participants who enrolled for the research methodologylecture. 

 

Lecture taken in  lecture hall 4 
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SRIVENKATESWARADENTALCOLLEGEANDHOSPITAL 

ClinicalResearchMethodologyWorkshop 
 
 

 
Date:26-08-2020&28-08-2020 Time:09.00AM-12.00PM 

Venue:Online-Googlemeet No.ofparticipants:78 
 
 

 
Summary: 

Sri Venkateswara dental college and hospital, Thalambur, organized a two 
daysresearch methodology lecture for about 78 attendees through the online 
googlemeet forum from 09.00 AM to 12.00 PM on 26/08/2020 and 28/08/2020. 
ThetopicBasicsofclinicalresearchandbiostatisticswascoveredon26thaugust,2020b
y Dr.SheejaVargheseandDr.Shyam presentedon 
thetopicCriticalappraisalon28thaugust,2020.Allparticipantswereawardedthecertif
icateofattendanceforthetwo days. 
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SRI VENKATESWARA DENTAL COLLEGE AND 

HOSPITALPATHWAYTOPUBLISHANDPROGRESS(12-12-2020&13-

12-2020) 

 
 

 
Date:12-12-2020&13-12-2020 Time:09.00AM-05.00PM 

Venue:Online No.ofparticipants:400 
 
 
DepartmentofConservativedentistryandEndodontics,SriVenkateswaradental college and hospital, Thalambur, organized 
a CDE pPG ORIENTATION PROGRAMME 1 

rogramme- Pathwayto publish and progress on 12th and 13th of December 2020. 
Topics like Rightway to write and Systematic reviews were covered and the 
participants weregivencertificate ofparticipationwere 
awardedforalltheparticipation. 
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SRIVENKATESWARADENTALCOLLEGEANDHOSPITAL 

Postgraduateorientationprogramme 

 

 
 

Date:31/07/2019 Time:09.00AM-02.00PM 

Venue:LectureHall2 No.ofparticipants:28 
 
 
Summary: 

Sri Venkateswara dental college and hospital, Thalambur, organized a one-
daypostgraduateorientationlectureforabout28attendeesonlecturehall2from 
09.00AMto02.00PM.ThetopicslikeCriticalappraisalofanarticle,presenting a 
seminar, how to select a dissertation topic and how to do researchwere all 
discussed with the participants during the orientation programme. 
Staff,postgraduates and interns attended the orientation programme and the 
certificateofattendancehasbeenissuedto alltheattendees. 
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SRIVENKATESWARADENTALCOLLEGEANDHOSPITAL 

Postgraduateorientationprogramme 

 

 
 

Date:12/11/2019,13/11/2019 Time:09.00AM-02.00PM 

Venue:LectureHall4 No.ofparticipants:100 
 
 
DepartmentofPeriodontics&ProsthodonticsjointlyorganizedandconductedaCDE
programmeonthetopic“Sevenhabitsofhighlyeffectivelmplantology” on 22nd & 
23rd September 2019 from 8:30 a.m to 2 p.minLecture hall-II of the College. 
International Speaker Dr. JOSHUA MICHAELSHIEH B.D.S, M.D.S (PERIO) 
delivered the guest lecture and enlightened theparticipants on the pre- 
requisites for an elective Implant practice. Students 
andstaffofthecollegeactivelyparticipatedintheprogramme.Totally100members 
were participated and Certificate of participation was given to thedelegates. 
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Workshop on Pedagogy in Dental Education

Date: 19/12/2018 Venue -Lecture Hall 3

Faculty name: Dr Sabitha Sudarsan

No of Participants -34 (Faculty) Time: 10.00 -3.00pm.

Pedagogy that supports development of practical and emancipatory knowledge

includes problem based learning and case methods, journals, storytelling, and

performance based assessment methods. These teaching strategies are integrated

into various dental curricula. So dental educators should develop these methods

to provide efficient and effective education for future practitioners in both the

art and science of dentistry.

Workshop on Pedagogy in Dental Education on 19/12/2018



Faculty Orientation Program to Manage Advanced and Slow Learners

Date: 23/01/2019 Venue - Lecture Hall 3

Faculty name: Dr Shanmuga Priya

No of Participants -34 (faculty) Time: 10.00 -3.00pm.

This program is to have thorough knowledge on management of advanced and

slow learners. Advanced and slow learners are identified on the basis of internal

assessment examinations,( terminal examinations) ,involvement in theclassrooms

and also in the department labs.

Faculty Orientation Program to Manage Advanced and Slow Learners on 23/01/2019



Workshop on Basic Life Support in Association with TACT

Date: 14/06/2019, 15/06/2019 Venue - Auditorium

Faculty name: Dr. Selvakumar, Mrs. sridevi

No of Participants -95 (Faculty-10, Students-85) Time: 9.00am -5.00pm.

Department of OMFS have conducted basic life support program on 14/06/2019 and

15/06/2019 in Auditorium from 9.00am -5.00pm. Course duration was for eight hours.

85 students and 10 faculty enrolled members have participated. Attendance was

marked in the participants list. All lectures were planned according to duration

and individual training for each participants regarding BLS training were given

in training dummies with all the necessary equipment. Sufficient time was given

for clearing doubts and objective based test was conducted at the end to test the

level of understanding of the participants.

Workshop on Basic Life Support on 14/06/2019, 15/06/2019



Workshop on Conflict of Interest in Research

Date: 04/09/2019 Venue:Lecture Hall 4,

Faculty name: Dr. S Arun Kumar

No of Participants -79 (Faculty-59, Students-20) Time: 10.00am -3.00pm.

This program is to have thorough and wide knowledge on competing interest

which is also known as conflict of interest. Dr Arun Kumar from Public Health

Department gave a detailed explanation on the topic.Faculty and the students

participated in the program. All of them were awarded with the participation certificate.

Workshop on Conflict of Interest in Research on 04/09/2019



Workshop on Biosafety Measures

Date: 04/10/2019 Venue -Lecture Hall 4,

Faculty name: Dr .ArunMozhi

No of Participants -50 (Faculty-39 , Students-11) Time: 10.00am -3.00pm.

Biosafety is the containment principles, technologies, and practices that are

implemented to prevent unintentional exposure to biological agents and toxins or their

accidental release. In simple terms, it may be described as protective measures that should

be taken for any dental procedure to control the spread ofmicrobial infections. This

program highlights about the rationale for biosafety requirements in a dental practice,

standard precautions have been described to prevent cross-infection and cross

contamination, the need for an aseptic protocol, identifying methods for ensuring

biosafety in the environment. Faculty and the students participated in the program.

Workshop on Biosafety Measures on 04/10/2019



Workshop on Typhodont

Date: 28/01/2021 &; 29/01/2021 Venue: Lecture hall 4

Time: 9am to 3pm

Faculty name: Dr. Bala Subramanian Madan and Dr. Lodd Mahendra

No of participants: 50(Faculty-5, Students- 45)

Many participants from throughout Tamil Nadu of different dental College

joined the program. This workshop included different wire bending exercises

from edgewise, Beggs technique, tweeds, formation of arch forms, different

loops used in segmental arch technique, V bend principles, speaker

demonstrated through camera in a bigger screen so everyone can get to know

about the tiny detail. Five faculty from our institute participated.

Workshop on Typhodont on 28/01/2021, 29/01/2021



One day lecture on Publication Ethics

Date: 10/02/2021 Venue: Lecture hall 2

Faculty name: Dr. K. MANIKANDAN, Dr. S ARUN KUMAR

No of participants: 50 (Faculty-37 , Students-13 ) Time: 9am to 3pm

This program was hosted for 1 day in which, How to write and submit a

scientific manuscript for publication typically in a peer reviewed journal was

discussed. Lecture was given by Dr. K.Manikandan and Dr.S Arun Kumar from

Public Health Dentistry.Fifty participants were enrolled. Certificates of

participation awarded to the all the participants.

One day lecture on Publication Ethics on 10/02/2021



Workshop on Basic Life Support in association with TACT

Date : 04/10/21, 05/10/21 Venue - Dr.Abdul kalam convention hall

No of Participants -80(Faculty-10, Students-70) Time: 8.30am -3.00pm.

Faculty name: Dr. Abishek

Department of OMFS have conducted basic life support programme on 04-10-

21 and 05-10-21 in Dr.Abdul kalam convention hall from 09.30 am-3.30 pm.

Course duration was for six hours. Seventy students and ten faculty enrolled

members have participated. Attendance was marked in the participants list. All

lectures were planned according to duration and individual training for each

participants regarding BLS training were given in training dummies with all

the necessary equipment. Sufficient time was given for clearing doubts and

objective based test was conducted at the end to test the level of understanding

of the participants.



Workshop on Basic Life Support on 04/10/21, 05/10/21



One Day Workshop on Grant Writing 

Date: 17/03/2022 Venue -Lecture Hall 3 

Faculty name: Dr Dr Shyam 

No of Participants -50 (Faculty) Time: 10.00 -3.00pm. 

workshop was conducted for grant writing methods for the benefit of the students, 

Post graduate students and staff that supports development of practical and 

emancipatory knowledge includes problem based learning and case methods, 

journals, storytelling, and performance 

based assessment methods. These teaching 

strategies are integrated into various dental 

curricula. So dental educators should 

develop these methods to provide efficient 

and effective education for future 

practitioners in both the art and science of 

dentistry. 

 

 

 

 



Search for Research 

Date: 15/02/2022 Venue -Lecture Hall 3 

Faculty name: Dr P D Madan Kumar 

No of Participants -50 (Faculty) Time: 10.00 -3.00pm. 

Research methodology workshop was conducted for sampling methods, sample 

size calculation and research proposal writing methods for the benefit of the 

students, Post graduate students and staff for the efficient conduct of research 

projects 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



Biostatistics 

Date: 15/12/2021 Venue -Lecture Hall 3 

Faculty name: Dr Arthi balasubramanium 

No of Participants -50 (Faculty) Time: 10.00 -3.00pm. 

Biostatistics workshop was conducted for sampling methods, sample size 

calculation and statistical methods for the benefit of the students, Post graduate 

students and staff for the efficient conduct of research projects.  

      



Workshop on rotary endodontics 

Date: 16/11/2021 Venue -Lecture Hall 3 

Faculty name: Dr Shobana Sekar 

No of Participants -50 (Faculty) Time: 10.00 -3.00pm. 

Rotary Endodontics workshop was conducted for briefing the various rotary 

systems, techniques and clinical application of the various endodontic systems in 

practice for the benefit of undergraduate and post graduate systems.  
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